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To Papi,

my first teacher

A teacher affects eternity;

he can never tell where his influence stops.

—Henry Adams



Precepts or maxims are of great weight;

and a few useful ones at hand do more

toward a happy life than whole volumes

that we know not where to find.

—Seneca
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M

PRECEPTS

y father’s name was Thomas Browne. And his father’s name was

Thomas Browne. That’s why my name is Thomas Browne. I

didn’t know until I was a college senior that there was a far more

illustrious Thomas Browne, who had lived in England in the

seventeenth century. Sir Thomas Browne was a gifted author, a

student of the natural world, a scientist, a scholar, and an outspoken

supporter of tolerance at a time when intolerance was the norm. In

short, I couldn’t have asked for a better namesake.

I started reading a lot of Sir Thomas Browne’s works in college,

including Enquiries into Very many received Tenets, and commonly

presumed Truths, a book that set out to debunk the prevalent false

beliefs of the day, and Religio Medici, a work that contained a

number of religious inquiries that were considered highly

unorthodox at the time. It was while reading the latter that I came

across this wonderful line:

We carry within us the wonders we seek around us.

The beauty and power of that line stopped me cold, for some

reason. Maybe it was exactly what I needed to hear at that particular

moment in my life, a time when I was racked with indecision about

whether the career I had chosen for myself—teaching—was full of

enough “wonder” to keep me happy. I wrote the line down on a little

slip of paper and taped it onto my wall, where it remained until I

graduated. I took it with me to graduate school. I traveled with the

Peace Corps and carried it in my wallet. My wife had it laminated

and framed for me when we got married, and it now hangs in the

foyer of our apartment in the Bronx.

It was the first of many precepts in my life, which I began

collecting in a scrapbook. Lines from books I’ve read. Fortune



cookies. Hallmark card homilies. I even wrote down the Nike ad line

“Just do it!” because I thought it was the perfect directive for me. You

can draw inspiration from anywhere, after all.

I first introduced precepts to my students as a student teacher. I

was having a hard time getting my kids interested in the essay-

writing unit—I believe I had asked them to write one hundred words

on something that meant a lot to them—so I brought in the

laminated Thomas Browne quote to show them something that

meant a lot to me. Well, it turned out they were much more

interested in exploring the meaning of the quote itself than they were

in its impact on me, so I asked them to write about that instead. I

was amazed at the things they came up with!

Ever since then, I’ve used precepts in my classroom. According to

Merriam-Webster, a precept is “a command or principle intended

especially as a general rule of action.” For my students, I’ve always

defined it in simpler terms: precepts are “words to live by.” Easy. At

the beginning of every month, I write a new precept on the board,

they copy it, and then we discuss it. At the end of the month, they

write an essay about the precept. Then at the end of the year, I give

out my home address and ask the kids to send me a postcard over the

summer with a new precept of their own, which could be a quote

from a famous person or a precept they’ve made up. The first year I

did this, I remember wondering if I’d get a single precept. I was

floored when, by the end of summer, every single student in each of

my classes had sent one in! You can imagine my further

astonishment when, the following summer, the same thing happened

again. Only this time, it wasn’t only from my current class that I

received postcards. I also got a handful from the previous year’s

class!

I’ve been teaching for ten years. As of this writing, I have about

two thousand precepts. When Mr. Tushman, the middle-school

director at Beecher Prep, heard this, he suggested that I collect them

and turn them into a book that I could share with the world.

I was intrigued by the idea, for sure, but where to start? How to

choose what precepts to include? I decided I would focus on themes



with particular resonance for kids: kindness, strength of character,

overcoming adversity, or simply doing good in the world. I like

precepts that somehow elevate the soul. I chose one precept for every

day of the year. My hope is that the reader of this book will begin

every new day with one of these “words to live by.”

I’m thrilled to be able to share my favorite precepts here. Many are

ones I’ve collected myself over the years. Some were submitted by

students. All mean a lot to me. As I hope they will to you.

—Mr. Browne



Teach him then the sayings of the past,

so that he may become a good example

for the children.… No one is born wise.

— The Maxims of Ptahhotep,

2200 BC
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THE SANDBOX VIRTUES

ere’s a secret, kids: parents spend a lot of time teaching you how

to be polite when you’re very young because, it’s a scientific fact,

the world is nicer to polite people. “Don’t forget to say please,” we

tell you. “Play nice. Say thank you.” These are elemental virtues. We

teach them because they’re good things to teach. And we want people

to like you.

By the time you guys get to middle school, though, our priorities

seem to shift. “Do well in school. Succeed. Study harder. Have you

finished your homework yet?” That’s what we tend to harp on then.

Somewhere along the way, we stop emphasizing those elemental

virtues. Maybe it’s because we assume you’ve learned them by now.

Or maybe it’s because we’ve got so many other things we want you to

learn. Or maybe, just maybe, it’s because there’s an unwritten law

about middle-school kids: it’s hard to be nice. The world may prefer

polite children, but other middle schoolers don’t seem to really

appreciate them. And we parents, eager to see you guys get through

these Lord of the Flies years, often turn a blind eye to some of the

mean stuff that passes for normal.

I personally don’t buy this notion that all kids go through a “mean

phase.” In fact, I think it’s a lot of malarkey! Not to mention a little

insulting to kids. When I talk to parents who tell me, as a way of

justifying something unkind their child has done, “What can I do?

Kids will be kids,” it’s all I can do not to bop them on their heads

with a friendship bracelet.

Here’s the thing: with all due respect, guys, I don’t think you’re

always equipped to figure things out on your own. Sometimes there’s

a lot of unnecessary meanness that happens while you’re trying to

sort out who you want to be, who your friends are, who your friends

are not. Adults spend a lot of time talking about bullying in schools



these days, but the real problem isn’t as obvious as one kid throwing

a Slurpee in another kid’s face. It’s about social isolation. It’s about

cruel jokes. It’s about the way kids treat one another. I’ve seen it with

my own eyes, how old friends can turn against each other: it seems,

sometimes, that it’s not enough for them to go their separate ways—

they literally have to “ice” their old buddies out just to prove to the

new friends that they’re no longer still friends. That’s the kind of

stuff I don’t find acceptable. Fine, don’t be friends anymore: but stay

kind about it. Be respectful. Is that too much to ask?

Na-hah. I don’t think so.

Every day at 3:10 p.m., my fifth graders stream out of Beecher

Prep at dismissal time. A few of you, the ones who live nearby, walk

home. Some of you take a bus or the subway. A lot of you, though,

are picked up by parents or caregivers. The point is, either way, most

parents don’t allow their kids to roam around the city without

knowing where they are, who they’re with, and what they’re doing.

Why is that? Because you’re still kids! So why should we let you roam

wild in the uncharted territory of middle school without just a little

bit of guidance? You’re asked to navigate social situations every day

—lunchroom politics, peer pressure, teacher relations. Some of you

do it very well on your own, absolutely! But others—and let’s be

honest here—don’t. Some of you still need a little help figuring things

out.

So, kids, don’t get mad at us if we try to help you in this regard. Be

patient with us. It’s always tricky, as a parent, striking the right

balance between too much intervention and too little. So bear with

us. We’re only trying to help. When we remind you about those old,

elemental virtues we used to teach you back in your toddler days,

when you were still playing in sandboxes, it’s because “playing nice”

is something that doesn’t end when you start middle school. It’s

something you need to remember every day as you walk through the

school hallways on your way to becoming adults.

The truth of the matter is this: there’s so much nobility lurking

inside your souls. Our job as parents, and educators, and teachers, is

to nurture it, to bring it out, and to let it shine.



—Mr. Browne
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THE LONGEST MONTH OF THE YEAR

like including a precept about discovery at this time of year. Why

this time of year? Because, although February is the shortest

month, it also happens to be the longest stretch of time without an

event to look forward to (Presidents’ Day notwithstanding). In

January, students have just come off the holiday high that is

December. With the rush of presents and the thrill of the first few

snowfalls behind them, by January 31 the realization hits: “We won’t

have another big stretch of vacation time until spring break!” Argh!

Hence: the February doldrums.

I’ve always found that it helps to get my students thinking about

unexplored frontiers—be they frontiers of the imagination or

geographical frontiers. The latter dovetail nicely with what they’re

usually doing in history at this time of year (exploring either ancient

China or ancient Greece, depending on their history teacher), and the

former are a great segue into my Creative Writing unit.

I recently used the James Thurber precept “It is better to ask some

of the questions than to know all the answers” and got a really

interesting essay back from a student named Jack Will.

I like this precept a lot a lot a lot. It makes me think about all the
stuff I don’t know. And maybe never, ever will know. I spend a lot
of time asking myself questions. Some are stupid questions. Like,
why does poop smell so bad? Why don’t human beings come in
as many shapes and sizes as dog breeds do? (I mean, a mastiff is
like ten times bigger than a Chihuahua, so why aren’t there
humans who are sixty feet tall?) But I also ask myself bigger
questions. Like, why do people have to die? Why can’t we just
print more money and give it to people who don’t have enough of
it? Stuff like that.



So, the big question I’ve been asking myself a lot this year is,
why do we all look the way we do? Why do I have one friend who
looks “normal” and another friend who doesn’t? These are the
kinds of questions that I don’t think I’ll ever know the answers to.
But asking myself the questions did make me ask myself another
question, which is, what is “normal” anyway?

So I looked it up in oxforddictionaries.com. This is what it said:

normal (adjective): Conforming to a standard; usual, typical, or
expected.

And I was like, “conforming to a standard”? “Usual? Typical?
Expected?” Ugh! Who the heck wants to be “expected” anyway?
How lame is that?

So that’s why I really like this precept. Because it’s true! It’s
better to ask some really awesome questions than it is to know a
lot of dumb answers to stupid stuff. Like, who cares what x equals
in some dumb equation? Duh! Answers like that don’t matter! But
the question “What is normal?” does matter! It matters because
there’s never going to be a right answer. And there’s no wrong
answer, either. The question is all that matters!

This is why I love using precepts in my classroom. You throw them

out there, and you never know what you’re getting back, what’s going

to strike a chord with a kid, or what’s going to make them think a

little deeper, a little bigger, than if they were just trying to answer a

question from a book. It’s one of the things I love most about

precepts: the sentiments they voice are usually about things that

human beings have been grappling with since the dawn of time. I

love that my fifth graders are doing the same!

—Mr. Browne

http://www.oxforddictionaries.com/
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A SPOONFUL OF KINDNESS

hen Tommy, my son, was three years old, my wife, Lilly, and I

took him for his annual checkup and the pediatrician asked us

what his eating habits were like.

“Well,” we confessed, “he’s going through this phase of only liking

chicken fingers and carbs, so we’ve kind of given up trying to get him

to eat vegetables for now. It’s become too much of a struggle every

night.”

The pediatrician nodded and smiled, and then said, “Well, you

can’t really force him to eat the veggies, guys, but your job is to make

sure they’re on his plate. He can’t eat them if they’re not even on his

plate.”

I’ve thought about that a lot over the years. I think about it with

teaching. My students can’t learn what I don’t teach them. Kindness.

Empathy. Compassion. It’s not part of the curriculum, I know, but I

still have to keep dishing it out onto their plates every day. Maybe

they’ll eat it; maybe they won’t. Either way, my job is to keep on

serving it to them. Hopefully, a little mouthful of kindness today may

make them hungry for a bigger taste of it tomorrow.

—Mr. Browne
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PLAY YOUR TILES

y grandparents were avid Scrabble players. They played every

night, whether they had company or not—on the same Scrabble

board they’d had for over fifty years. Their matches were formidable

because they were both incredible players. Interestingly, my grand-

father, who was known in my family as being the “intellectual,”

almost always lost to my grandmother. It’s not that Grandma wasn’t

every bit as smart as Grandpa, by the way—it’s just that he was the

one who had gotten a degree at Columbia while Grandma stayed

home to raise my mother and her sisters. Grandpa was a lawyer, and

Grandma was a homemaker. Grandpa had a library of books, and

Grandma liked doing crosswords. Grandpa hated to lose, and

Grandma whipped his butt nine out of every ten games for over fifty

years.

One time I asked Grandma what her secret to winning was, and

she said, “It’s simple. Just play your tiles.”

“Okay, Grandma, a little elaboration is needed here,” I answered.

“Here’s why I always beat your grandfather. He hoards his tiles.

When he gets good letters, he holds on to them, waiting to play them

on a triple-word score. He’ll skip a turn to try and get a seven-letter

word to get the fifty-point bonus. Or he’ll trade in his letters in the

hope he’ll get better ones. That’s no way to play!”

“It’s his strategy,” I said, trying to defend him.

She waved her hand in the air dismissively. “Me, I just play my

tiles—whatever tiles I get. Doesn’t matter if they’re good letters or

bad letters. Doesn’t matter if they’re on a triple-word score or not.

Whatever tiles I get, I play. I make the most of them. That’s why I

always beat your grandpa.”

“Does he know this?” I asked. “Haven’t you ever shared this secret

with him?”



“What secret? He’s watched me play every night for fifty years—do

you think my way of playing is a secret? Play the tiles you get! That’s

my secret.”

“Grandpa,” I said later to my grandfather. “Grandma told me the

reason she always beats you at Scrabble is because she always plays

her tiles and you hold on to yours. Have you ever thought about

changing your style of playing a bit? Maybe you would win more

often!”

Grandpa poked his finger into my chest. “That’s the difference

between your grandma and me,” he answered. “I want to win, but

only if I can win beautifully. Big, long words. Words no one’s ever

heard of before. That’s me. Your grandmother, she’s fine winning

with nothing but a string of A’s and O’s. You know the old saying:

Suum cuique pulchrum est! To each, his own is beautiful.”

“That may be true, Grandpa, but Grandma’s kicking your butt!” I

said.

Grandpa laughed. “Suum cuique pulchrum est!”

—Mr. Browne
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YOUR ACTIONS ARE NOTED

very now and again I have to remind my students that they’re not

invisible. “I can see you rolling your eyes!” I tell them. They think

this is funny—usually. And it is—usually. But the other night I was

reminded of how easy it is for kids to forget that their actions are,

indeed, noted.

I was attending the upper-school play at Beecher Prep and took a

seat next to the mother of one of my former students, whom I’ll call

Briana. This was a sweet, bright girl who had experienced some

difficulties with a group of mean girls in middle school. Briana was

shy and a little awkward, so I was surprised when her mom told me

that she’d been cast in the lead role of the play. Her mom was so

proud! She said that her daughter had really come out of her shell in

upper school, due largely to the recognition she’d gotten for her

singing and acting talent.

When the play started, the moment Briana came onstage, I

understood what her mom meant. Gone was that awkward little girl I

remembered from fifth grade, replaced by a very confident leading

lady who could easily have been mistaken for a young Nicole

Kidman. “Good for you, Briana!” I thought to myself. But no sooner

had she finished singing her first verse than I noticed, sitting a

couple of rows in front of us, those same three girls who used to

taunt her in middle school. None of them even went to the school

anymore (they hadn’t been accepted to the upper school largely

because of the school’s strong anti-bullying commitment). These

girls snickered the moment Briana came onstage. They whispered to

one another behind open hands. I’m sure they didn’t think anyone

was noticing them, but I could see out of the corner of my eye that

Briana’s mom saw everything as clearly as I did. I can’t even describe

the look on her face. It was heartbreaking.



I waited for Briana to finish her solo. The moment the applause

started, I leaned over the seat in front of me and tapped the shoulder

of one of the girls. She turned around and started to smile when she

saw me, but then she noticed my expression as I mouthed the words

Shut up! The other girls saw this, too.

I think the shock of seeing Mr. Browne, their formerly mellow

English teacher, so angry, using language that he had never used

with them before, had its intended effect: they were quiet as church

mice for the rest of the first act. During intermission, they quickly

disappeared and didn’t come back for Act Two.

By the time the play ended, I had almost forgotten about those

idiotic girls amid the thunderous applause. I turned to Briana’s mom

to congratulate her on her daughter’s truly brilliant performance.

She was smiling, but there were tears in her eyes. I don’t know if they

were tears of pride or if there was a trace of bitterness over the fact

that those girls had marred what should have been a completely

joyful night for her. All I know is that my memory of those girls will

be forever altered by their thoughtless behavior that night. I’m sure

they didn’t mean for Briana’s mom to see them, but it doesn’t matter.

Your actions are noted, kids. And remembered.

—Mr. Browne
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WE ARE STARDUST!

have to admit, I love getting postcard precepts in the summer.

Some of them come on real postcards. Others come as part of

longer letters, like this one:

Dear Mr. Browne,
Here’s my precept: “If you can get through middle school without

hurting anyone’s feelings, that’s really cool beans.”
I hope you are having a super-nice summer! My mom and I

went to visit Auggie’s family in Montauk on July 4th! They had
fireworks on the beach! PLUS—there was a telescope on his roof!
Every night I got to go up and look at the stars! Did I ever tell you
that I want to be an astronomer when I grow up? I know all the
constellations by heart. I also know a lot about the science of
stars. For instance, do you know what stars are made of? Maybe
you do because you’re a teacher, but a lot of people don’t. A star is
pretty much just a giant cloud of hydrogen and helium gases.
When it gets old, it starts to shrink, which kind of creates all these
other elements. And then when all the elements get so tiny they
can’t go anywhere, they explode and send all their stardust into
the universe! That dust is what forms planets and moons and
mountains—and even people! Isn’t that so awesome? We’re all
made of stardust!

Love,                      
Summer Dawson

Yep, I sure do love my job. As long as little kids like Summer keep

reaching for the stars, I’ll be here to cheer them on.

—Mr. Browne
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FRESH STARTS

ometimes people surprise you. You think you have them figured

out, but they’ll do something that makes you realize just how

fathomless the human heart truly is. To that end, and because the

heart of a child is still such a work in progress, no one can surprise

you more than a child. This happened to me over the course of a

recent email exchange with a former student. This kid did not have a

great year in fifth grade. Most of it was his own doing: he made bad

choices. He was something of a bully, and the tide turned against

him, as it should have. He found that his small-minded dislikes

weren’t as universal as he thought, and that he was alone in his

prejudices.

However, I always suspected that there was a little bit more to this

boy than that. His personal essays betrayed a more feeling heart than

his actions implied. At times, it was hard to reconcile the boy who

could be so hateful with the boy who wrote the essays. So I held out

hope for him. And when I got an email from him over the summer, I

couldn’t have been happier.

 

To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: julianalbans@ezmail.com

Re: My precept

Hi, Mr. Browne! I just sent you my precept in the

mail: “SOMETIMES IT’S GOOD TO START OVER.” It’s

on a postcard of a gargoyle. I wrote this precept

because I’m going to a new school in September. I

ended up hating Beecher Prep. I didn’t like the

students. But I DID like the teachers. I thought



your class was great. So don’t take my not going

back personally.

I don’t know if you know the whole long story,

but basically the reason I’m not going back to

Beecher Prep is . . . well, not to name names,

but there was one student I really didn’t get

along with. Actually, it was two students. (You

can probably guess who they are.) Anyway, these

kids were not my favorite people in the world. We

started writing mean notes to each other. I

repeat: each other. It was a 2-way street! But

I’m the one who got in trouble for it! Just me!

It was so unfair! The truth is, Mr. Tushman had

it in for me because my mom was trying to get him

fired. Anyway, long story short: I got suspended

for two weeks for writing the notes! (No one

knows this, though. It’s a secret, so please

don’t tell anyone.) The school said it had a

“zero tolerance” policy against bullying. But I

don’t think what I did was bullying! My parents

got so mad at the school! They decided to enroll

me in a different school next year. So, yeah,

that’s the story.

I really wish that “student” had never come to

Beecher Prep! My whole year would have been so

much better! I hated having to be in his classes.

He gave me nightmares. I would still be going to

Beecher Prep if he hadn’t been there. It’s a

bummer.

I really liked your class, though. You were a

great teacher. I wanted you to know that.

To: julianalbans@ezmail.com

Fr: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Re: Re: My precept



Hi, Julian. Thanks so much for your email! I’m

looking forward to getting the gargoyle postcard.

I was sorry to hear you won’t be coming back to

Beecher Prep. I always thought you were a great

student and a gifted writer.

By the way, I love your precept. I agree,

sometimes it’s good to start over. A fresh start

gives us the chance to reflect on the past, weigh

the things we’ve done, and apply what we’ve

learned from those things to the way we move

forward. If we don’t examine the past, we don’t

learn from it.

As for the “kids” you didn’t like, I do think I

know who you’re talking about. I’m sorry the year

didn’t turn out to be a happy one for you, but I

hope you take a little time to ask yourself why.

Things that happen to us, even the bad stuff, can

often teach us a little bit about ourselves. Do

you ever wonder why you had such a hard time with

these two students? Was it, perhaps, their

friendship that bothered you? Were you troubled

by Auggie’s physical appearance? You mentioned

that you started having nightmares. Sometimes

fear can make even the nicest kids say and do

things they wouldn’t ordinarily say or do.

Perhaps you should explore these feelings

further?

In any case, I wish you the best of luck in

your new school, Julian. You’re a good kid. A

natural leader. Just remember to use your

leadership for good, huh? Don’t forget: always

choose kind!

To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: julianalbans@ezmail.com



Re: Re: Re: My precept

Thanks so much for your email, Mr. Browne! It

really made me feel good! Like, you really “get”

me. And you don’t think I’m a bad kid, which is

nice. I feel like everyone thinks I’m this “demon

child.” It’s nice to know you don’t.

I had begun to read your email and my

grandmother saw me smiling so she asked me to

read it aloud to her. Grandmère is French. I’m

staying with her in Paris for the summer. So I

read it to her. And we got into this whole long

talk after. Grandmère’s old, but she’s still kind

of with it. And anyway, guess what? She totally

agreed with you! She thinks maybe I was kind of

mean to Auggie because I was a little afraid of

him. And after talking to her about it, I think

maybe you guys are right. The thing about the

nightmares I was having is that I used to get bad

nightmares when I was little. Night terrors.

Anyway, I hadn’t had one in a long time, but the

first time I saw Auggie in Mr. Tushman’s office,

I started having them again. It sucked! It

actually made me not want to go to school because

I didn’t want to see his face again!

I know I would have had a better year if Auggie

had never come to Beecher Prep. But I know it’s

not his fault that he looks the way he does. My

grandmother told me this long story about a boy

she knew when she was a girl, and how kids used

to be mean to him. It made me feel so sorry for

him! It made me feel bad about some of the things

I said to Auggie.

So anyway, I wrote Auggie a note. I don’t have

his address, though, so can I mail it to you so

that you could mail it to Auggie? I don’t know



how much the stamp costs, but I’ll totally pay

you back. (It’s a nice note, btw! Don’t worry!)

Thanks again, Mr. Browne. Seriously. Thanks!

To: julianalbans@ezmail.com

Fr: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Re: Proud!

Julian, I can’t tell you how proud I am that

you’ve taken this big step! I would be honored to

mail that note to Auggie for you when I get it

(and you don’t have to worry about paying me back

for the stamp). Looks like you’re really living

up to your precept. Good for you, Julian!

Look, the truth is, it’s not easy coping with

fear. In fact, it’s one of the hardest things

human beings have to face. That’s because fear

isn’t always rational. Do you know the origin of

fear? It goes back to the dawn of mankind. When

we were pre-humans, we developed fear as a

mechanism to survive in a tough world— poisonous

snakes and spiders, saber-toothed cats, wolves.

The instinctual response to a perceived danger

would trigger adrenaline inside us, and we could

run away faster, or fight better, in response to

that perceived danger. It’s a very natural

instinct, Julian. To be afraid is one of the

things that make us human.

But another thing that makes us human is our

ability to deal with fear. We have other traits

that we rely on that help us cope with our fears.

The ability to be courageous despite our fear.

The ability to regret. The ability to feel. The

ability to be kind. These traits work together,

along with fear, to make us better people.



Next year is going to be a great year for you,

Julian. I can feel it. I have faith in you! Just

give everyone a chance and you’ll do fine. Best

of luck to you!

 

Sometimes, all a kid needs is a little push to have a revelation. I’m

not saying I was that push. I think Julian’s very wise grandmother

was. The point is: everyone’s got a story. The challenge with some

kids is to be patient enough to listen.

—Mr. Browne
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GLITTER

indness can spread from person to person like glitter. Anyone

who’s ever introduced glitter into any kind of art project at school

knows exactly of what I speak. You can’t shake it off you. You pass it

on to the next person. Its sparkling remnants linger for days. And for

each tiny dot you find, you know that a hundred more have

seemingly vanished. But where did they go? What happens to all that

glitter?

I had a boy in my class last year whose name was August. He was

quite special, and not because of his face. There was just something

about his indomitable spirit that captured me (and a lot of the people

around him). The year turned out to be a raging success for Auggie. I

was very glad about that. Now, I’m not naive enough to think that a

happy ending to a fifth-grade year will guarantee him a happy life. I

know he’ll have more than his share of challenges. But what I

gleaned from his triumphant year was this: he has what he needs

inside of him to stand up to life’s challenges. Auggie will have a

beautiful life. That’s my prediction.

I got an email from him the other day that kind of validates this

prediction.

 

To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: apullman@beecherschool.edu

Re: The postcard

Hey there, Mr. Browne! Long time no speak!

I hope you’re having a great summer! I sent you

my precept last month. Hope you got it. It had a

giant fish on it. From Montauk.



So I’m writing to thank you for sending me

Julian’s note in the mail. Whoa, I did not see

that coming! When I opened your letter I was,

like, what is this other envelope? And then I

opened it and I saw the handwriting. And I was

like, no way, is Julian sending me mean notes

again? You probably don’t know this, but Julian

left some really mean notes in my locker last

year. Anyway, it turned out that this note wasn’t

a mean note! It was actually an apology! Can you

believe it? It was sealed, so maybe you didn’t

read it, but this is what the note said:

DEAR AUGGIE,

I WANT TO APOLOGIZE FOR THE STUFF I DID LAST

YEAR. I’VE BEEN THINKING ABOUT IT A LOT. YOU

DIDN’T DESERVE IT. I WISH I COULD HAVE A DO-OVER.

I WOULD BE NICER. I HOPE YOU DON’T REMEMBER HOW

MEAN I WAS WHEN YOU’RE EIGHTY YEARS OLD. HAVE A

NICE LIFE.

—JULIAN

PS: IF YOU’RE THE ONE WHO TOLD MR. TUSHMAN ABOUT

THE NOTES, DON’T WORRY, I’M NOT MAD.

I’m kind of in a state of shock about this

note. By the way, he’s wrong about me being the

one who told Mr. Tushman. It wasn’t me (or Summer

or Jack). Maybe Mr. Tushman really does have

microscopic spy satellites tracking everything we

do in school! Maybe he’s even watching me … right

NOW! If you’re listening, Mr. Tushman, I hope you

had a great summer! Anyway, just goes to show,

you never know with people!

To: apullman@beecherschool.edu



Fr: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Re: Re: The postcard

Hey there, Auggie (and Mr. Tushman, if you’re

listening). I just wanted to write you a quick

little note to say how happy I am that you got

some closure with Julian. There’s nothing that

can make up for what he put you through, but

there must be some satisfaction in knowing that

he’s grown as a person because of you. You’re

right: you just never know with people. See you

next month!

To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: apullman@beecherschool.edu

Re: The truth revealed?

Yeah, it’s true. You never know! I showed my mom

the postcard and she just about fainted. “Will

wonders never cease!” she said. Then I told Jack

and he was like, “Did you check the postcard for

poison?” You know Jack. But seriously, I don’t

know what might have motivated Julian to write

the apology, but I really appreciated it. The one

thing I still don’t know is: WHO TOLD MR. TUSHMAN

ABOUT THE NOTES? Was it you, Mr. Browne?

To: apullman@beecherschool.edu

Fr: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Re: Re: The truth revealed?

Ha! I promise, it wasn’t me who told Mr. Tushman.

I had no idea about those awful notes! It may

just be one of those mysteries that never get

solved!



To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: apullman@beecherschool.edu

Re: Re: The truth revealed?

 

So here’s the thing about glitter: once it’s out of the bottle, there’s

just no way of putting it back. It’s the same with kindness. Once it

pours out of your soul, there’s no way of containing it. It just

continues to spread from person to person, a shining, sparkling,

wonderful thing.

—Mr. Browne
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CHOOSING KIND

’ve always thought that good teaching is about illumination. Sure,

we teach things kids might not know, but a lot of the time, we’re

just shedding light on the stuff they already do know. There’s a lot of

that happening in the fifth grade. Kids know how to read, but I’m

trying to get them to love reading. Kids know how to write, but I’m

trying to inspire them to express themselves better. In both

instances, they have the materials they need already inside them: I’m

just here to guide them a bit, to shed a little light. To illume.

That’s one of the reasons I like to start every year off with the Dr.

Wayne W. Dyer precept about “choosing kind.” The kids are all new

to middle school. A lot of them don’t know each other. I think of this

precept as a preemptive strike against much of what is to come, an

inception in their psyches. I plant a little notion of kindness so that at

least it’s there, this seedling buried inside them. Will it take root?

Will it flower? Who knows? But either way, I’ve done my deed.

When given the choice between being right or being kind,

choose kind.

—Dr. Wayne W. Dyer

This particular quote usually provokes days of discussion after I

introduce it. I often start my conversation about precepts with a

general survey: Do you like the precept? Does it apply to how you live

your life? What do you think it means?

Then I start talking about the obvious benefits of the precept. If

everyone adopted that quote as his or her own personal precept, I

ask them, wouldn’t the world be a better place? Imagine if nations

adopted it as a mandate—wouldn’t there be fewer conflicts? Some



kids agree, adding that if nations chose to be kind instead of right, it

might even end world hunger. Other kids argue that being wealthy

doesn’t have anything to do with being right.

I sometimes ask the students how hard it would be for them to

choose to back down from an argument with their moms or dads or

siblings if they knew they were right and the other person was wrong.

Would they give in just to let the other person save face? Why? Why

not? This part of the discussion is often very lively!

It’s not so simple a thing to choose to be kind. It’s one thing to

back down from an argument with someone you love—a friend, say—

because you don’t see the point in “winning” the argument at the cost

of your friend’s feelings. But what if you believe in something that no

one else believes in? What if you’re the only one who knows you’re

right? Should you back down, just to be kind? What if you were

Galileo and you knew you were right about the planets revolving

around the sun, even though the rest of the world thought you were

crazy—would you back down? What if you were living in the 1950s

and you were against segregation—would you back down, just to be

polite? What if you were standing up for something you believed in—

would you really want to back down, just for the sake of kindness?

No! You’d stand up and fight, right?

All this will often lead to some kids questioning whether the

precept is really good, after all. At this point, I always suggest to

them that maybe the most important words in the precept aren’t

“kind” or “right.” Maybe the most important word in that whole

sentence is the word “choose.” You have the choice. What do you

choose?

As I said, my job is to plant the notion in your minds, kids.

Inception. Once the seed is planted, all I try to do is keep shedding

some light on it. And watch it grow. In time, you’ll begin shining your

own lights, and then—watch out, world!

—Mr. Browne
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OF BABOONS AND MEN

read an article a few years ago about a couple of biologists who

studied a troop of baboons over a twenty-year period. This

particular troop was full of very aggressive “alpha” male baboons

that routinely attacked and bullied the females and weaker males in

the troop, depriving them of access to food sources. This proved

unexpectedly advantageous one day when the alpha males ate

infected meat. They all died, but the females and weaker males

survived. Within a short time, the baboon troop took on a totally new

dynamic. They were significantly less aggressive, more social, and,

behaviorally, less “stressed” than before. What’s more, these changes

lasted long after that first generation of “nicer” baboons died out.

New baboons joining the troop assimilated the less aggressive

behavior and passed it on. The transmission of “kindness”—if such it

could be called—took root. And it grew.

So, why am I talking about baboons? No, I’m not about to compare

a class of fifth graders to baboons, don’t worry! But I am going to go

out on a limb (ha, no pun intended) and draw the following lesson: a

small, dominant clique can set the tone for a group. Ask any teacher.

If you’re lucky enough to have a few alpha kids in your class who can

set a positive tone for the year, you’re in for a good year. Conversely,

if you happen to get a few dominant kids who are bent on making

trouble, then fasten your seat belts!

Last year turned out to be a great year. Although the usual fifth-

grade antics were intensified by the Auggie and Julian “rift,” which

ended well for Auggie, there was little drama among the girls.

Summer, with her self-confident, sprightly nature, was a great

influence. I had another student, Charlotte, who was also very sweet.

We had this exchange via Google Docs the other day:

 



Hi, Mr. Browne. I’m writing an article for the school newspaper
and was wondering if I could interview you about precepts.
Hope you have the time.

Hi, Charlotte. I’d be happy to help.

Oh yay! Thank you! First of all, did you get my precept over the
summer? “It’s not enough to be friendly. You have to be a
friend.”

Yes, I did! Thank you for sending it. I liked it very much.

Thanks! You’re probably wondering why I chose that precept.

Yes, actually. I’m very curious.

Oh, well, here’s why. Do you remember at graduation, how
Auggie won the Beecher Award? I thought that was so cool
because he really deserved it. But I also kind of thought that
other people should have won it, too. Like Jack. And Summer.
They were such good friends to Auggie—even in the beginning,
when kids were running away from him.

Hey, this part isn’t going to be in the newspaper, right?

Totally not!

Just checking! Sorry to interrupt.

No prob. It’s just that I started thinking about how I had never
really gotten to know Auggie myself. Like, I was nice to him. I
said hello in the hallways. I was never mean to him. But, you



know, I never did what Summer did. I never sat down with him
at lunchtime. I never defended him to my friends, like Jack did.

Don’t be too hard on yourself, Charlotte. You were always very
nice.

Yeah, but “being nice” is not the same as “choosing kind.”

I see your point.

This year, I started sitting at the “summer” table. It’s me,
Auggie, Summer, Jack, Maya, and Reid. I know some kids still
don’t like being around Auggie, but that’s their problem, right?

Very right.

So anyway, back to the newspaper article. I was wondering if
you could share with readers why you first started collecting
precepts? What inspired you?

Hmm. I guess I first came upon the notion of collecting precepts
when I was in college. I happened upon the writings of Sir
Thomas Browne, a seventeenth-century man of all trades, and
found his work deeply moving.

Seriously? His name was Thomas Browne?

Incredible coincidence, isn’t it?

So when did you start teaching precepts to kids?

Not too long afterward, when I started student teaching.
Actually, it’s funny that you’re asking me these questions,



because I’ve been thinking about putting together a book of all
the precepts I’ve collected over the years, along with some
essays in which I touch upon some of the very questions you’re
asking me.

Really? That is such an awesome idea! I would totally buy that
book!

Good! I’m glad you like it.

So I think those were the only questions I had. I’m looking
forward to reading your book when it comes out.

Thank you. Bye, Charlotte!
 

What I loved most about this exchange was the idea that Charlotte

herself realized the profound impact of kindness.

I began this essay with a true story of baboons, and ended with the

story of a girl. In both, the transmission of kindness had taken root.

What can biologists and teachers alike do but marvel at its impact?

—Mr. Browne
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HEROES

ne of my students dressed up as Frodo for Halloween last month,

which caused me to casually make this offhand remark: “I love

Frodo, but, let’s face it, Samwise Gamgee is the greatest hero of

Middle-earth.”

Well, you would have thought I’d just said we were doing away

with Halloween or something, judging from the number of gasps and

“No way!”s I got. I don’t remember the last time one of my

statements generated so much controversy in my classroom!

Although the class was more or less evenly split between Aragorn

and Frodo as the greatest hero—with some Gandalf advocates—not

one person agreed with me about Samwise.

So I tried to elaborate on my crazy thinking. Sam, I reminded

them, was the loyal companion to Frodo through thick and thin. All

those times Frodo was about to give up, Sam kept him going. When

Frodo couldn’t carry the ring anymore, Sam took Frodo on his back

across the desolate plains of Mordor. When Sam thought Frodo was

dead, he took the ring himself and set about to destroy it. And when

the ring started working its seduction on him, Sam was one of the

few creatures in all of Middle-earth who were able to resist the

temptation. In a way, I told the kids, Sam stands as a shining

example of the four virtues. In classical antiquity, it was believed that

to be a truly great person, one should have in equal proportions the

following four virtues:

WISDOM: prudence, as garnered from experience, or the
ability to respond appropriately to any given situation.

JUSTICE: the ability to fight for what is right. The perpetual and
constant will to render to each one his right.



COURAGE: the ability to confront fear, uncertainty, or
intimidation.

TEMPERANCE: the ability to practice moderation—even when
tempted to give in to one’s own self-interest or desire.
Temperance is the art of self-control.

Samwise Gamgee is the epitome of all those virtues, I told my

students. But then they pointed out that he wasn’t especially wise,

which I had to give them. And he didn’t really live for Justice, which I

had to give them, too. Ultimately, we decided, as a whole, that Sam

stood for Temperance. He never gave in to his own wishful thinking,

but stood fast and firm to help his friends.

“So what other fictional heroes can we think of that stand for the

other virtues?” I asked the kids. And this is where the fun began! I

gave them a couple of days to do some research, and then we had our

class discussion.

For Wisdom, the most common name offered was: Yoda. “Come

on!” I rebuked in a comical way. “Really? That’s such an obvious

answer.” I told them I thought the wisest character, if we were going

the Star Wars route, was Luke Skywalker. Not at first, of course. But

after Luke learned to master his own feelings and gained a deeper

insight into others’ feelings, he became a calm, cool, and collected

Jedi Knight, who was smart enough to take on the dark side of the

Force. They were not convinced. Apparently, Luke holds less appeal

for the under-forty crowd than Yoda.

For Justice, we turned to The Chronicles of Narnia. Edmund, who

actually becomes King Edmund the Just after redeeming himself,

was the fairly unanimous choice.

For Courage, we went to the world of superheroes. A big debate

arose about Superman versus Batman. Superman, it was pointed out,

was very courageous, but then again, he was impervious to

everything, except Kryptonite (and how many people carry

Kryptonite in their pocket, right?). Batman, on the other hand, was



just an ordinary guy with lots of gadgets, who was seriously brave.

This remained an unresolved dispute, and just may be for the rest of

time.

I actually used that great rivalry to bring up one of my all-time

favorites: Achilles versus Hector. It was a fun way for me to

introduce this ancient feud to those who hadn’t heard about it.

Basically, I told them, Achilles was the greatest hero of the Greeks.

His mother was a goddess, and when he was a baby, she dunked him

in the river Styx and made him invincible—except for his heel, which

was where she was holding him. What’s more, Achilles’s armor was

forged by a god, making him even more impossible to defeat. And to

top it all off, Achilles was the best-trained warrior of all time: the

dude liked to fight! Hector, on the other hand, who was the

champion of the Trojans, did not like to fight. Nor did he have a

goddess for a mother or a god to forge his armor. In fact, he was just

an ordinary guy who was especially good with a sword, fighting to

save his home when one thousand Greek ships invaded his shores.

Then I told the kids about the epic fight between Achilles and

Hector. They were so excited by it! Who says kids can’t be taught the

classics anymore?

The final virtue to be debated was Temperance. What character

from a book or movie best embodied the art of self-control? We

turned to the world of Harry Potter for that one. Seems like Harry

himself, though sometimes something of a rule-breaker, never

abused his unique powers for self-gain. As one student said, he could

have used his invisibility cloak a hundred times to do bad things, but

he didn’t. Instead, he used his powers for the greater good. That’s the

great lesson Rowling teaches.

It was quite a wonderful teaching day for me, one that sprang

completely from a boy in a costume. Although I may have veered off-

topic for a day, I think the lessons learned were more valuable than

anything in today’s curriculum.

Teachers need the freedom to teach—freedom they can’t have if

they’re only teaching so their students can pass tests. I’m pretty sure

my students won’t find anything about Hector on the Common Core

tests. I’m equally sure that what they learned about Wisdom, Justice,



Courage, and Temperance may stay with them for the rest of their

lives.

—Mr. Browne
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MYSTERIES

ecember. The end of the year. The start of a new year. A chance to

remember. A chance to look forward. It was nice hearing from

some of my former students: Auggie. Summer. Charlotte. And, of

course, the biggest surprise to me of all—Julian. That is, until I got

this short and pithy email from Amos, one of my students from last

year. This boy, who was generally a quiet kid, not one to speak up in

class, surprised us all when he came to the rescue of Auggie and Jack

at the nature retreat last year. He led the charge and showed great

leadership. Sometimes kids don’t even know they’re leaders until

they start to lead.

When I got this email, it was the answer to one little mystery (that

I know I wasn’t the only person to wonder about).

 

To: tbrowne@beecherschool.edu

Fr: amosconti@wazoomail.com

Subject: My precept—at last!

Hey, Mr. B, hope you have a happy holiday! Sorry

I didn’t get around to sending you a postcard

over the summer. Had a lot going on, you know?

But here goes: “Don’t try too hard to be cool. It

always shows, and that’s uncool.”

What do you think? Cool, huh? I won’t explain

what my precept means because it’s pretty

obvious, right? I mean, you probably know who I’m

talking about, right? Hee-hee-hee.

No, seriously. Last year was tough, man! Lots

of drama! Yo, I’m not into drama, usually. That’s



why I was so sick and tired of that stuff going

on with Julian. There’s not a lot of drama this

year, which is good. No one bothers Auggie

anymore. I mean, a little, but not too much.

Let’s face it, people are always going to stare a

bit. But Auggie’s a tough little dude and no one

messes with him anymore.

Okay, look, I’m going to let you in on a little

secret. Ready? So, you know how Julian got in big

trouble for leaving mean notes in Auggie’s

locker, right? Everyone says it’s the real reason

Julian’s not coming back to school next year.

I’ve even heard a few people say he was actually

suspended for it! Anyway, the big mystery is: how

did Mr. Tushman even find out about the notes?

Auggie didn’t tell him. Jack didn’t tell him.

Summer didn’t tell him. Julian didn’t tell him.

Miles didn’t tell him. And Henry didn’t tell him.

You know how I know? Because … drumroll here … it

was me! I’m the one who told Mr. Tushman about

the notes. Didn’t see that coming, did you?

So let me explain a bit. What happened was that

Henry and Miles knew Julian was leaving the mean

notes. They told me about the notes but made me

swear not to tell anyone. But after they told me,

I thought it just really sucked big-time that

Julian was being so mean to Auggie. It was kind

of like bullying. And even though I swore to

Henry and Miles that I wouldn’t say anything, I

needed to tell Tushman about it so he could do

something to protect Auggie. Hey, I’m an

upstander—not a bystander! Little dudes like

Auggie need guys like me to step it up, right?

So that’s the story, Mr. B. Don’t go telling

anyone, though! I don’t want to be accused of

being, you know, a “snitch.” Then again, I guess



I don’t really care. I know I did the right

thing.

Keep warm, Mr. B! It’s cold out there!

 

Yeah, maybe it’s cold out there, but this warmed my heart

completely. I have to admit: I did not see that one coming. Just goes

to show, everyone really does have a story to tell. And most people, at

least in my experience, are a little more noble than they think they

are.

—Mr. Browne
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APRIL 17: Artwork by Matthew, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.

APRIL 19: Original precept by Anna, age 10, Glenview, Ill.

MAY 5: Vince Lombardi quote contributed by Emma, age 10, Dresden, Ohio.

MAY 7: Original precept by Grace, age 12, Croton-on-Hudson, N.Y.

MAY 14: Original precept by Dustin, Bennington, Vt.

MAY 16: Original precept by Gavin, age 10, Wilmette, Ill.

MAY 21: Original precept by Srishti, age 10, Troy, Mich.

MAY 27: Original precept by Flynn, age 10, Bowdoinham, Me.

MAY 28: Original precept by Madeline, age 11, Quebec, Canada.

JUNE 4: Bob Marley quote contributed by Angelina, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.

JUNE 16: Original precept by Clare, age 11, State College, Penn.

JUNE 17: Original precept by Josh, age 10, Troy, Mich.



JUNE 25: Original precept by Emma, age 11, Croton-on-Hudson, N.Y.

JUNE 26: Original precept by Paco, age 26, Brazil.

JUNE 30: Original precept by Caleb, age 17, Brooklyn, N.Y.

JULY 12: Unknown precept contributed by Julia, age 10, Troy, Mich.

JULY 15: Anthony Robbins quote contributed by Cole, age 14, Regina, Sask., Canada.

JULY 20: Original precept by Mae, age 11, Marblehead, Mass.

JULY 23: Original precept by Matea, age 12, Regina, Sask., Canada.

AUGUST 5: Artwork by Ashley, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.

AUGUST 10: Doug Floyd quote contributed by Abby, age 10, Merrick, N.Y.

AUGUST 26: Original precept by Ava, age 11, Blackstone, Mass.

AUGUST 30: Artwork by Ali, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.

SEPTEMBER 8: Unknown precept contributed by Samantha, age 13, Regina, Sask.,
Canada.

SEPTEMBER 13: Original precept by Zöe, Greensboro, N.C.

SEPTEMBER 16: Original precept by Alexis, age 10, Quebec, Canada.

SEPTEMBER 24: Proverb contributed by Tayler, age 10, Dresden, Ohio.

SEPTEMBER 26: Original precept by Riley, age 10, St. George, Utah.

SEPTEMBER 29: Original precept by Elizabeth, age 9, Nashville, Tenn.

OCTOBER 3: Original precept by John, age 10, West Windsor, N.J.

OCTOBER 5: Dr. Seuss quote contributed by Katherine, Greensboro, N.C.

OCTOBER 14: Original precept by Daniel, age 12, Munich, Germany.

OCTOBER 22: Unknown precept contributed by Nate, age 10, Brooklyn, N.Y.



NOVEMBER 3: Original precept by Clark, age 12, Regina, Sask., Canada.

NOVEMBER 8: Original precept by J.J., Scotch Plains, N.J.

NOVEMBER 14: Taylor Swift quote contributed by Nikki, age 17, East Brunswick, N.J.

NOVEMBER 20: Original precept by Hailey, age 11, Chicago, Ill.

NOVEMBER 21: Les Misérables quote contributed by Katherine, age 11, San Diego, Calif.

NOVEMBER 27: Original precept by Nicolas, age 10, State College, Penn.

NOVEMBER 29: Original precept by Joseph, age 9, Brooklyn, N.Y.

DECEMBER 8: Original precept by Hanz, age 13, Regina, Sask., Canada.

DECEMBER 9: Original precept by Mairead, age 11, Franklin, Mass.

DECEMBER 13: C. S. Lewis quote contributed by Chidiadi, age 12, Regina, Sask.,
Canada.

DECEMBER 14: Charles M. Schulz quote contributed by Dani, age 14, East Brunswick,
N.J.

DECEMBER 15: Original precept by Brody, age 10, Forked River, N.J.

DECEMBER 21: Original precept by Ainsley, age 10, Lakeview, N.Y.

DECEMBER 27: Original precept by Christina, El Paso, Tex.

DECEMBER 31: Original artwork: fox by Kevin, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.; duck by
Prasansha, age 11, Jackson Heights, N.Y.

Special thanks to Nikki Martinez, Dani Martinez, and Joseph Gordon for their help with
additional art.

NOTE ON SOURCES: Every possible measure has been taken to ensure that the quotes in
this book are attributed to their original sources. However, over the centuries, old maxims
have had a way of resurfacing with variations in wording or different translations. For this
book, where a famous quote or saying is commonly attributed to a specific person without
dispute, the most common attribution is used, even if its original source cannot be verified.
Where a quote is occasionally disputed, the attribution is credited as “unknown.”
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